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Tattooed Teardrops is the winner of the Top Fiction award for the 2016 In the Margins Best Books for Teens
book award!

A realistic and beautiful story filled with suspense, heartbreaking friendship and loyalty award-winning
author P.D. Workman's brings you the intriguing story of Tamara’s struggle to make a life for herself after
her incarceration. But things aren’t going to be easy. 

“I don’t plan on getting in any trouble.”

Tamara had thought that when she got out of juvie, things would be easier. But before long, it seems like her
life is spiraling into chaos.

If she can’t prove to her probation officer that she is innocent of the allegations against her, she’s going back
to prison, and Tamara just can’t let that happen.

By the author of Ruby, Between the Cracks, a winner of the Top Ten Best Books for Teens 2015 award,
Tamara's poignant story will change the way you think about the nature of evil.

Praise for Tattooed Teardrops

—For me, a sign of a good book is that it is a quick read, holds my interest front to back and I like the
characters. This book met the mark on all three of those characteristics. 

—A slimy villain, an eager-to-please side-kick and a heroine who simply wants to move on from her past
make for an intriguing tale, indeed! A realistic and beautiful story filled with suspense, heartbreaking
friendship and loyalty that will keep you reading until the very end.

Praise for P.D. Workman

“Every single one of [P.D. Workman’s] books has spoken to me in ways no one or almost anything else has.
And I have found strength in the books I've read."

"The way that P.D. Workman writes just flows amazingly and allows the reader to get really invested in a
book."
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From reader reviews:

Damon Smith:

The actual book Tattooed Teardrops will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading the book. The
author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see, this book very suited
to you. The book Tattooed Teardrops is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
from official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Carol Shull:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Tattooed Teardrops your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect
that maybe not known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve
then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get before. The Tattooed
Teardrops giving you an additional experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful
details for your better life in this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind
will probably be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try
this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Robin Harvey:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting Tattooed Teardrops that give
your satisfaction preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading routine all over the world
can be said as the way for people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the world. It
can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who
wants to become success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you
may pick Tattooed Teardrops become your own personal starter.

Nancy Stever:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Tattooed Teardrops book written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who all read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still question Tattooed Teardrops as good book not just by the cover but also
through the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still
needing one more sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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