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For courses in Microsoft Office Professional for Windows, Access for Windows, Word for Windows,
PowerPoint for Windows, Excel for Windows, and Introduction to Operating Systems The Learn Series uses
a proven approach to guide students through the basics of the latest software applications. The Learn
manuals provide visual step-by-step guides with simple directions, multiple screen shots, and plenty of
exercises. They are designed for 6-8 contact hours. The manuals include the OnDemand Personal Navigator
CD-ROM that provides textbook specific computer based training in both live and simulated environments.
Students use the software and the accompanying data files to complete the in-text exercises. The Learn
Series has been designed for students who need to master the basics of a particular software program
quickly. The books are highly visual in nature which allows the beginning student to work along with the
book. This is particularly suited to students with limited computer skills or for a course that emphasizes
independent learning.
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From reader reviews:

Freida Gilbert:

In other case, little people like to read book Learn PowerPoint 2000. You can choose the best book if you
appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book Learn PowerPoint 2000.
You can add understanding and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the
fact from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will be
known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or
searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's study.

Elmer Pereira:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all
people in the world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above.
Every person has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or
something that they don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Learn
PowerPoint 2000. All type of book can you see on many methods. You can look for the internet resources or
other social media.

Shane Hamilton:

This Learn PowerPoint 2000 book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information inside this book incredible fresh,
you will get data which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This Learn
PowerPoint 2000 without we realize teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't always be worry Learn PowerPoint 2000 can bring when you are and not make your case
space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even telephone. This Learn
PowerPoint 2000 having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not really feel
uninterested in reading.

William Holmes:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Learn PowerPoint 2000 can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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