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For over two decades, this comprehensive manual has been the standard introduction and complete reference
for writing articles and books containing mathematical formulas. If the reader requires a streamlined
approach to learning LaTeX for composing everyday documents, Grätzer’s © 2014 Practical LaTeX may
also be a good choice.

In this carefully revised fifth edition, the Short Course has been brought up to date and reflects a modern and
practical approach to LaTeX usage. New chapters have been added on illustrations and how to use LaTeX on
an iPad.

Key features:

An example-based, visual approach and a gentle introduction with the Short Course●

A detailed exposition of multiline math formulas with a Visual Guide●

A unified approach to TeX, LaTeX, and the AMS enhancements●

A quick introduction to creating presentations with formulas●

From earlier reviews:

Grätzer’s book is a solution.

—European Mathematical Society Newsletter

There are several LaTeX guides, but this one wins hands down for the elegance of its approach and breadth
of coverage.

—Amazon.com, Best of 2000, Editor’s choice

A novice reader will be able to learn the most essential features of LaTeX sufficient to begin typesetting
papers within a few hours of time… An experienced TeX user, on the other hand, will find a systematic and
detailed discussion of LaTeX fea

tures.

—Report on Mathematical Physics

A very helpful and useful tool for all scientists and engineers.   —Review of Astronomical Tools
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From reader reviews:

Adrian Woodson:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book More Math Into LaTeX. All type
of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Carol Williams:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this More Math Into LaTeX book
written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who read
the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate
your personal hunger then you still skepticism More Math Into LaTeX as good book not merely by the cover
but also by the content. This is one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you
still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so
why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Angela Latham:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book More Math Into LaTeX was vibrant and of course
has pictures around. As we know that book More Math Into LaTeX has many kinds or category. Start from
kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the character
on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try
to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Herbert Knight:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By the
book More Math Into LaTeX we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To be creative
person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't become doubt to
change your life at this book More Math Into LaTeX. You can more inviting than now.
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