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To his friends and neighbors, Glenn L. Carle was a wholesome, stereotypical New England Yankee, a former
athlete struggling against incipient middle age, someone always with his nose in an abstruse book. But for
two decades Carle broke laws, stole, and lied on a daily basis about nearly everything. “I was almost never
who I said I was, or did what I claimed to be doing.” He was a CIA spy. He thrived in an environment of
duplicity and ambiguity, flourishing in the gray areas of policy.

The Interrogator is the story of Carle's most serious assignment, when he was surged to become an
interrogator in the U.S. Global War on Terror, and assigned to interrogate a top-level detainee at one of the
CIA's notorious black sites overseas. It tells of his encounter with one of the most senior al-Qa'ida detainees
the U.S. captured after 9/11, a ghost “detainee” who, the CIA believed, might hold the key to finding Usama
Bin Ladin.

As Carle's interrogation sessions progressed, he began to seriously doubt the operation. Was this man,
kidnapped in the Middle East, really the senior al-Qa'ida official the CIA believed he was? Headquarters
viewed these misgivings as naïve troublemaking, so Carle found himself isolated and progressively at odds
with his institution and his orders. He struggled over how far to push the interrogation, wrestling with
whether his actions constituted torture, and with what defined his real duty to his country. Then, in a
dramatic twist, Headquarters spirited the detainee and Carle to the CIA's harshest interrogation facility, a
place of darkness and fear, which even CIA officers dared mention only in whispers.

A haunting tale of sadness, confusion, and determination, The Interrogator is a shocking and intimate look at
the world of espionage. It leads readers through the underworld of the Global War on terror, asking us to
consider the professional and personal challenges faced by an intelligence officer during a time of war, and
the unimaginable ways in which war alters our institutions and American society.
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From reader reviews:

Julie Bell:

This The Interrogator: An Education book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information inside this publication
incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get.
That The Interrogator: An Education without we know teach the one who looking at it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Interrogator: An Education can bring if you are
and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop
even phone. This The Interrogator: An Education having excellent arrangement in word along with layout, so
you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Melvin Hayes:

The ability that you get from The Interrogator: An Education could be the more deep you digging the
information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book
is hard to be aware of but The Interrogator: An Education giving you joy feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by anyone who read that because the author of
this publication is well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it
easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you
for having this The Interrogator: An Education instantly.

Juanita Geil:

This The Interrogator: An Education usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The explanation of this The Interrogator: An Education can be among the great books you must
have will be giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with information that
maybe will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and
whenever your conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Interrogator: An Education
forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking
that we know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Jesse Williams:

This The Interrogator: An Education is completely new way for you who has interest to look for some
information since it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you
know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Interrogator: An Education can be the
light food for yourself because the information inside this book is easy to get by anyone. These books build
itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think
that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and knowledge.
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