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Foreword by Adam Zamoyski

Kaleidoscope of Poland is a highly readable volume containing short articles on major personalities, places,
events, and accomplishments from the thousand-year record of Polish history and culture. Featuring
approximately 900 compact text entries and 600 illustrations, it will be a handy reference at home, a perfect
supplement to traditional guide books when traveling, an aid to language study, or simply browsed with
enjoyment from cover to cover by anyone with an interest in Poland.
The entries describe essential features of Poland from the mundane to the sublime. Whether it is bagels or the
Bug River, Chopin or Madame Curie, the authors offer colorful and often witty snapshots of significant
individuals, customs, folklore, historic events, phrases, places, geography, and much, much more. Beginning
with the emergence of the Polish state in 966 under Mieszko I, to the resurrection of present-day Poland
within the European Union, it’s also a sweeping account of the tumult and triumphs the nation has witnessed
through much of its history.
This highly entertaining yet informative book is essentially a “cultural dictionary”—offering a knowledge
base that can be referred to time and time again. Kaleidoscope of Poland will be welcomed by readers of
Polish descent, students of Polish, or anyone planning to visit Poland—anyone seeking a greater insight into
this fascinating land.
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From reader reviews:

Hattie Leclair:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed Kaleidoscope
of Poland: A Cultural Encyclopedia (Pitt Russian East European)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you.
You understand beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Donald Rivera:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Kaleidoscope of Poland: A
Cultural Encyclopedia (Pitt Russian East European) will make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably
more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading a new book
make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you looking for
best book or suitable book with you?

Eun Christensen:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Kaleidoscope of Poland: A
Cultural Encyclopedia (Pitt Russian East European) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out
this book? Let's find.

Juan Gilbert:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book.
Different categories of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra
Kaleidoscope of Poland: A Cultural Encyclopedia (Pitt Russian East European).
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