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Unfortunately, the divorce rate is on the rise-especially within the church! As a result, there are many single
moms who daily face their own burdens of guilt and fear, all the while trying to care for their children and
provide a stable home. These moms need special help, guidance, discipleship, and companionship.

There is help! This life-transforming program is a ten-week journey for single moms-focusing on healing the
past, help for the present, and hope for a confident future. New Start for Single Moms is a program that pairs
a mentor and a single mom together to explore potential, meet daily challenges, build peaceful homes, and
accomplish dreams.

The kit includes:

Ten DVD lessons that correspond with the Participant and Facilitator Guides●

Mentor training and recruitment tips●

Comprehensive facilitator guide●

Weekly discussion guides and communication tools●

Printable forms, worksheets, posters, and flyers on CD-ROM●
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From reader reviews:

Hannelore Evans:

The actual book New Start for Single Moms Kit will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading
some sort of book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book
to learn, this book very suited to you. The book New Start for Single Moms Kit is much recommended to
you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Johnnie Nystrom:

The actual book New Start for Single Moms Kit has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you
can get a lot of gain. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of
write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can find the point easily after looking over this
book.

Jason Harden:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love New Start for Single Moms Kit,
you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is
it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Ruby Guillen:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This New Start for Single Moms Kit can be the
respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your spare time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?
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