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In the mid-1990s Linda and Larry Faillace had a dream: they wanted to breed sheep and make cheese on
their Vermont farm. They did the research, worked hard, followed the rules, and, after years of preparation
and patience, built a successful, entrepreneurial business. But just like that, their dream turned into a
nightmare. The U.S. Department of Agriculture told them that the sheep they imported from Europe (with
the USDA's seal of approval) carried a disease similar to the dreaded BSE or "mad cow disease." After
months of surveillance--which included USDA agents spying from nearby mountaintops and comically
hiding behind bushes--armed federal agents seized their flock. The animals were destroyed, the Faillace's
lives turned upside down, all so that the USDA could show the U.S. meat industries that they were protecting
America from mad cow disease--and by extension, easing fears among an increasingly wary population of
meat-eaters. Mad Sheep is the account of one family's struggle against a bullying and corrupt government
agency that long ago abandoned the family farmer to serve the needs of corporate agriculture and the
industrialization of our food supply. Similar to the national best-selling book, A Civil Action, readers will
cheer on this courageous family in its fight for justice in the face of politics as usual and the implacable
bureaucracy of the farm industry in Washington, DC.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Romero:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind the USDA's War on a
Family Farm. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important a new book Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind the USDA's War on a Family Farm. You can add
know-how and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can understand everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching
by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

Maria Casillas:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind
the USDA's War on a Family Farm, it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still need to
miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't obtain it, oh
come on its identified as reading friends.

James Haney:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This book Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind the USDA's War on a
Family Farm was colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Mad Sheep:
The True Story Behind the USDA's War on a Family Farm has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on
there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and unwind.
Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Leslie Woodson:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind the
USDA's War on a Family Farm to make your personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading
proficiency is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to
read it and mingle the idea about book and studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to
open up a book and read it. Beside that the book Mad Sheep: The True Story Behind the USDA's War on a
Family Farm can to be a newly purchased friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what must
you're doing of these time.
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