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This annual anthology brings together the year's finest mathematics writing from around the world. Featuring
promising new voices alongside some of the foremost names in the field, The Best Writing on Mathematics
2016 makes available to a wide audience many articles not easily found anywhere else--and you don't need
to be a mathematician to enjoy them. These writings offer surprising insights into the nature, meaning, and
practice of mathematics today. They delve into the history, philosophy, teaching, and everyday occurrences
of math, and take readers behind the scenes of today's hottest mathematical debates.

Here Burkard Polster shows how to invent your own variants of the Spot It! card game, Steven Strogatz
presents young Albert Einstein's proof of the Pythagorean Theorem, Joseph Dauben and Marjorie Senechal
find a treasure trove of math in New York's Metropolitan Museum of Art, and Andrew Gelman explains why
much scientific research based on statistical testing is spurious. In other essays, Brian Greene discusses the
evolving assumptions of the physicists who developed the mathematical underpinnings of string theory,
Jorge Almeida examines the misperceptions of people who attempt to predict lottery results, and Ian Stewart
offers advice to authors who aspire to write successful math books for general readers. And there's much,
much more.

In addition to presenting the year's most memorable writings on mathematics, this must-have anthology
includes a bibliography of other notable writings and an introduction by the editor, Mircea Pitici. This book
belongs on the shelf of anyone interested in where math has taken us--and where it is headed.
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From reader reviews:

Vicki Shah:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016. You can
choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of
book The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the
world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your
country right up until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is
possible to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet product. It is
called e-book. You need to use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Joshua Mack:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
To be sure that book is very important usually. The book The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016 has been
making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The reserve The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016 is not only giving you more new
information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to
read your publication. Try to make relationship together with the book The Best Writing on Mathematics
2016. You never experience lose out for everything should you read some books.

Jeffrey Lambert:

This book untitled The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016 to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Raymond Crandall:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Best Writing on Mathematics 2016 can
be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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