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In November, 1944, the Japanese began launching 9,300 unmanned bomb-carrying balloons (Fugo) that
were carried east over the Pacific Ocean by the jet stream. The bombs were intended to drop over America
and explode, causing forest fires, general panic and deaths. However, without a reliable guidance system,
most of the balloons did not reach North America. The US Government suppressed information about the
project, and fortunately most of the bombs fell into the ocean or exploded harmlessly. Only six deaths
occurred. Japan stopped the launches in 1945. Now, almost 70 years later, a group of terrorists using modern
computer technology and the latest GPS guidance systems will try and succeed where the Japanese failed. It
will be up to an unlikely group, including the President, the National Security Advisor, the Secretaries of
Defense for both the United States and Russia, and the sister of the terrorist mastermind, herself a recent
recruit for the CIA, to find a way to stop one of the deadliest terrorist attacks on US soil.
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From reader reviews:

Lavonne Ouellette:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Fugo book as basic and
daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Kathe Waller:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a e-book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When you read this
Fugo, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire
others, make them reading a reserve.

Elsie Hawkins:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to you is Fugo this reserve consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world
now. This book was represented how does the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage
of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some exploration when he makes this book.
That's why this book appropriate all of you.

Melissa Broussard:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book Fugo.
You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make
you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place
to other place.
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