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In this love story of impossible odds, award-winning writer Tim Z. Hernandez weaves a rich and visionary
portrait of Bea Franco, the real woman behind famed American author Jack Kerouac’s “The Mexican Girl.”
Set against an ominous backdrop of California in the 1940s, deep in the agricultural heartland of the Great
Central Valley, Mañana Means Heaven reveals the desperate circumstances that lead a married woman to an
illicit affair with an aspiring young writer traveling across the United States.

When they meet, Franco is a migrant farmworker with two children and a failing marriage, living with
poverty, violence, and the looming threat of deportation, while the “college boy” yearns to one day make a
name for himself in the writing world. The significance of their romance poses vastly different possibilities
and consequences.   

Mañana Means Heaven deftly combines fact and fiction to pull back the veil on one of literature’s most
mysterious and evocative characters. Inspired by Franco’s love letters to Kerouac and Hernandez’s
interviews with Franco, now in her nineties and living in relative obscurity, the novel brings this lost gem of
a story out of the shadows and into the spotlight.
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From reader reviews:

Vicky Moore:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Mañana Means
Heaven (Camino del Sol) suitable to you? Often the book was written by famous writer in this era. The book
untitled Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del Sol)is one of several books that everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this publication you will
enter the new dimensions that you ever know just before. The author explained their idea in the simple way,
therefore all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this guide. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world on this book.

Joseph Williams:

Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del Sol) can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article writer giving
his/her effort to place every word into delight arrangement in writing Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del
Sol) however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource
information that maybe you can be among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into new stage
of crucial considering.

Donald Lester:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than can satisfy your
short space of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be learn.
Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del Sol) can be your answer as it can be read by you who have those short
time problems.

Allison Larson:

Beside this kind of Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del Sol) in your phone, it may give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh in the
oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to
have Mañana Means Heaven (Camino del Sol) because this book offers to you personally readable
information. Do you oftentimes have book but you would not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on,
that will not happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be
questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book and also
read it from at this point!
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