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On February 14, 1863, twenty-six-year-old seaman James Henry Gooding volunteered to serve in the
Massachusetts 54th, the first regiment of black soldiers ever recruited for the Union army. Over the next
twelve months, he posted a series of remarkable letters from the front to his hometown newspaper, the
staunchly abolitionist New Bedford Mercury. Written with insight and literary flair, his letters provide a
vidid portrait of the war as seen through the eyes of a black volunteer.

From basic training at Camp Meigs in Readville, Massachusetts, through campaigns in Georgia, South
Carolina, and Florida, Gooding faithfully records the activities of the 54th, including the legendary storming
of Fort Wagner. He also voices the injustice felt by soldiers of his regiment over the issue of unequal pay, the
refusal to promote deserving black enlistees to officer rank, and the deeply ingrained racism of whites in
both the North and South.

Wounded and captured during the battle of Olustee, Florida, in February 1864, Gooding died later that year
in Andersonville Prison.

In her introduction, Virginia M. Adams provides biographical details on Gooding's life and examines the
antebellum history of New Bedford's large and articulate community of free blacks.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Jones:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare
time to take a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book
called On the Altar of Freedom: A Black Soldier's Civil War Letters from the Front? Maybe it is for being
best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you
can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have additional opinion?

Nellie Wellborn:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide On the Altar of Freedom: A Black
Soldier's Civil War Letters from the Front will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more
confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading a book
make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best
book or suited book with you?

Bess Malloy:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy read
one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The On the Altar of Freedom: A Black
Soldier's Civil War Letters from the Front is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Bessie Starns:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your kids, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is
this On the Altar of Freedom: A Black Soldier's Civil War Letters from the Front.
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