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Why is life so hard for me and so easy for everyone else? We all want to explore our dreams and live an
abundant life but so many of us are too afraid to do so. This is often because of negative experiences we have
had in the past. It can seem that some people are faced with challenge after challenge in their lives while
others seem to fl oat along without a care in the world. When you are one of those who struggle daily with
overwhelming problems, it can be hard to see the potential your life has for good. Gaby Abdelgadir had
every excuse to fail. She came from a war-torn part of the world and had experienced more adversity by the
time she was a teen than most people experience their whole lives. Still, she was undeterred and set out to
make a new life in a country half-way around the world. She is a striking example of what's possible when
you make an irrevocable decision to step out of your comfort zone and go for your dreams. Through the
heartache and struggles, Gaby clung to the knowledge that she had a glorious purpose that as yet had been
defined. Gaby's life is proof that you can rise above anything life throws in your path and be a stronger,
better person for having weathered the hard times. She offers hope and sage words of advice for those in the
trenches of despair right now so they will know that while life isn't perfect, it can be filled with joy and
happiness. About the Author Gaby Abdelgadir has a Business Administration Diploma with over 30 years of
international experience working with corporate companies as a Legal Assistant, Executive and Senior
Administrative Assistant. Gaby has a deep passion for continuous self-development and spirituality. She is
an avid reader and loves travel, art, writing and spending quality time with family and friends.
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From reader reviews:

Beverly McKeever:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds. Try
to make the book Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds as your buddy. It means
that it can to get your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it
is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Sara Otoole:

The book with title Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds includes a lot of
information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist
new knowledge the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you
with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it
anywhere you want.

Colleen Williams:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or their
friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read any book.
It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole day to reading
a publication. The book Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds it is quite good to
read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this
book. If you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
quickly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high
quality.

Laura Thibodeau:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. From the book Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds we can acquire more
advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? Being creative person must like to read a book. Just
choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this
book Grace Peace Balance: Surviving and Thriving Against All Odds. You can more attractive than now.
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