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This volume deals with the so-called Tell el-Yahudiyeh ware - black vessels with incised decoration - that is
found throughout the Eastern Mediterranean regions. This type of pottery dates to the Middle bronze Age.
This volume is part of the Tell el-Dabca excavation series, but it is more than a mere catalogue of the el-
Dabca finds. The monograph opens with a review of previous research into this type of pottery. The last
major reference work to deal with the topic appeared more than thirty years ago. Naturally, in the intervening
three decades many more vessels of this type have come to light, including nearly 700 from the el-Dabca site
alone. The second section of the book is devoted to a typological discussion of all Tell el-Yahudiyeh vessels
known to the authors. These are arranged both chronologically and geographically, starting from their origins
in the Levant and continuing to their widespread use throughout the Eastern Mediterranean. This is the first
time that a chronological overview has been attempted. It has shown that there are several development
threads, including Early Palestinian, Levanto-Egyptian, Late Palestinian and Late Egyptian groups. Each
type of vessel is described in detail and accompanied by a map showing where examples have been found.
The third and most important section comprises an in-depth catalogue of all 699 vessels that have been found
at Tell el-Dabca. The stratigraphic context of these vessels is well documented, which helps not only to date
the various types of Tell el-Yahudiyeh vessels, but also allows close correlations to be drawn between all
sites where such vessels have been found. Indeed, the fine stratigraphy of Tell el-Dabca, which has been
verified at a number of sites in the Eastern Mediterranean, allows Tell el-Yahudiyeh ware to be used as fine
datum lines for establishing the relative chronology of the sites where it is found. A conclusion is followed
by three chapters providing details about the Tell el-Yahudiyeh vessels that have been found at Ashkelon,
Beth Shan and Tell 'Arqa. These three contributions, by L. Stager and R. Voss, A. Meier and R. Mullins, and
H. Charaf and M. Ownby respectively, compare northern vessels to those from Tell el-Dabca. While this
volume will be of particular interest to specialists in Ancient Egyptian and Near Eastern ceramics, the ability
to closely date this ware also means that the volume will also be of use to archaeologists working in Egypt,
the Near East, Cyprus and the Aegean, as well as anyone attempting to provide datum lines between different
sites in these areas.
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From reader reviews:

Noah Cale:

Here thing why this specific Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya
Ware (Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie) are different and dependable to be yours. First of all reading
through a book is good but it really depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delightful
as food or not. Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya Ware
(Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
publication out there but there is no guide that similar with Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and
Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya Ware (Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie). It gives you thrill reading
through journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably
can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your means home
by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Tell el-Daba`a VIII:
The Classification and Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya Ware (Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie) in e-book
can be your alternate.

Warren Ford:

Precisely why? Because this Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya
Ware (Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie) is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you
to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book adjacent to it
was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes the content interior easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of positive
aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking way. So
, still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Alla Haynes:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and
Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya Ware (Denkschrift Der Gesamtakademie), you could enjoy both. It is very
good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind
hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Martin Kelley:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of



news. On this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
Tell el-Daba`a VIII: The Classification and Chronology of Tell el-Yahudiya Ware (Denkschrift Der
Gesamtakademie) when you desired it?
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