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In late 15th-century Italy, there was a growing demand for goods of all types, including art. Painting under
Pressure shows how the increased desire for art objects exerted significant pressure on highly sought-after
painters. Michelle O'Malley analyzes the lives and works of four artists: Alessandro Botticelli, Domenico
Ghirlandaio, Filippino Lippi, and Pietro Perugino. She considers network systems, production practices,
economic concepts, and workshop input to demonstrate the consequences of high demand on some of the
most respected artists of the time.

 

In this fascinating and incisive book, O’Malley asks how painters approached the manufacture of large
bodies of commissioned work, how they made day-to-day decisions about design and the application of
pigments, and how serial production related to creating work for commissions, in addition to questions of
economics. Using documentary evidence about price, scientific evidence about production, and formal
analysis about appearance, the book demonstrates Renaissance business practices and shows the individual
approaches artists took to producing excellence and meeting high demand.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Beatty:

The book Painting under Pressure: Fame, Reputation, and Demand in Renaissance Florence will bring
someone to the new experience of reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In
case you try to find new book to learn, this book very acceptable to you. The book Painting under Pressure:
Fame, Reputation, and Demand in Renaissance Florence is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Kevin Lemon:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Painting under Pressure: Fame, Reputation, and Demand in
Renaissance Florence why because the amazing cover that make you consider concerning the content will
not disappoint anyone. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th
sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Larry Devries:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Painting under Pressure:
Fame, Reputation, and Demand in Renaissance Florence can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book
you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era
is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Shelley Gavin:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. Within
this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
the Painting under Pressure: Fame, Reputation, and Demand in Renaissance Florence when you essential it?
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