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The mysteries of a natural gourmet treasure.

Truffles are the naturally growing, fragrant and prized fungus of European forests. In this gorgeous book,
truffle importer Annemie Dedulle, known as "Ms. Truffle," and culinary author Toni de Coninck reveal the
most intimate secrets of these elusive delicacies that fetch exorbitant prices.

Truffles features lush color photographs of the Hungarian and Italian countryside where truffles grow and
the hunters, chefs and connoisseurs (and dogs) whose lives revolve around them.

The book covers such topics as:

What is a truffle?●

The history of truffles●

Types of truffles●

Products featuring truffles●

Hunting for truffles●

What to look for when purchasing truffles●

Truffles and wine●

Map of Europe showing where truffles are found.●

A book on truffles would not be complete, however, if it did not provide recipes. The authors and the chefs
of three renowned European restaurants share such delectable recipes as:

Omelet with black and white truffles●

Truffle salad●

Sole with black truffle●

Fresh truffle risotto.●

Truffles is a loving celebration of the coveted truffle -- an essential choice for chefs, gourmet shops, cooking
schools and foodies everywhere.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Howard:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book Truffles: Earth's Black Diamonds
will make you to always be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about everything.
But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun.
Why they are often thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Jennifer Tomasini:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Truffles: Earth's Black Diamonds.
All type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Matthew Sammons:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Truffles: Earth's
Black Diamonds suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Truffles: Earth's Black Diamondsis a single of several books which everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new
way of measuring that you ever know just before. The author explained their concept in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to recognise the core of this guide. This book will give you a wide
range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world on this book.

Amy Smith:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with soon.
The Truffles: Earth's Black Diamonds provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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