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How do Christian practitioners express authentically holistic transformational development? This is the
challenge to World Vision development practitioners and to all non-government organizations concerned
about community development that addresses the whole person and the entire community.   This dilemma is
rooted in the western assumption that the physical and spiritual realms are separate and distinct from one
another. Such a dichotomy leads to a belief among practitioners that restoring people's relationship with God
has nothing to do with restoring just political, social and economic relationships among people. Even
Christians often believe God's redemptive work takes place in the spiritual realm, while the world is
seemingly left to the devil.   But the Bible never separates the physical from the spiritual - the rule of God
permeates both. In this volume, development practitioners struggle to overcome the problem of dualism and
find a way toward a more genuinely holistic approach to helping the poor. Experienced development
practitioners reflect on:  - Understanding poverty - Participatory learning and action - Appreciative inquiry -
The Bible and transformational development - Sustainable economic development - Community
transformation in the urban context - Community development and peacebuilding  Everyone wanting to
engage in transformational development will find new insights and essential learnings from these hands-on
practitioners.
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From reader reviews:

Kate Sutton:

The book Working with the Poor: New Insights and Learnings from Development Practitioners gives you the
sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book
can to become your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you
can make reading through a book Working with the Poor: New Insights and Learnings from Development
Practitioners to become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your capable, increase your
knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a guide Working
with the Poor: New Insights and Learnings from Development Practitioners. Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Lynn Kelley:

The publication untitled Working with the Poor: New Insights and Learnings from Development
Practitioners is the reserve that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content
that will be shown to anyone. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand.
The article author was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share to you
personally is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Working with the Poor: New Insights and
Learnings from Development Practitioners from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Michael Watkins:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is actually Working with the Poor: New Insights and Learnings from Development
Practitioners.

Robert Colgan:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Working with the Poor: New Insights and
Learnings from Development Practitioners is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the
beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy
the actual e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. And
so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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