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Learn effective animal handling and restraint techniques! Animal Restraint for Veterinary Professionals,
2nd Edition describes each procedure with two to eight photos showing the exact steps needed to achieve
safe restraint. A chapter is devoted to each domestic animal species, including cats, dogs, cattle, horses,
sheep, goats, pigs, rabbits, rodents, ferrets, and birds. New to this edition are updated photographs showing
the latest and greatest restraint procedures for all types of animals. Written by expert veterinary technician
educators C.C. Sheldon, Teresa Sonsthagen, and James Topel, this practical guide also includes a chapter on
knot tying!

Step-by-step guidelines make it easy to understand safe, proper restraint procedures.●

Over 500 full-color photographs illustrate restraint procedures.●

A clear, non-technical writing style along with descriptive photographs simplifies animal restraint●

concepts.
Comprehensive coverage in each chapter includes normal and abnormal behavior characteristics,●

precautions, special handling, restraint devices, and descriptions of medical procedures ? such as
venipuncture ? for which special restraint procedures are necessary.
Restraint Principles chapter summarizes the considerations for restraint, animal safety,●

circumstances for restraint, the effect of restraint on animals, and complications. 
Knot Tying chapter presents basic types of knots that may be used to safely restrain larger animals.●

UPDATED chapters include behavioral observations describing what to look for in the animal being●

restrained.
NEW full-color photographs accompany new restraint procedures for various species.●

NEW! Alternative restraint techniques are added, accompanied by step-by-step photos.●
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From reader reviews:

Carrie Porter:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't have
spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question
since just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on guardería until university need this Animal Restraint for Veterinary Professionals, 2e
to read.

Stanley Wells:

Often the book Animal Restraint for Veterinary Professionals, 2e will bring someone to the new experience
of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new
book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Animal Restraint for Veterinary Professionals, 2e is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker
to read the book.

Michael Lockwood:

Animal Restraint for Veterinary Professionals, 2e can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. All
of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The
article author giving his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Animal Restraint for
Veterinary Professionals, 2e however doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition
to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can
easily drawn you into new stage of crucial imagining.

Sean Jones:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So you
know that little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by book.
Amount types of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Animal Restraint for
Veterinary Professionals, 2e.
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