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Christian Durant, a student at Leland University, worked his way through college at a local retailer, Stearns
and Company. Though he studied history at Leland, he completed a minor in business and upon graduation
moved into the management training program at Stearns and Company. Years later, serving as a store
manager, Christian marries Leigh Whitfield and is approached by an old friend, Scott Pierce, with an
opportunity to join him in a start-up manufacturing business. Christian and Leigh join their friends-Scott and
his wife, Carol-as they learn more than they thought imaginable about starting and managing a business.
Then tragedy strikes. Scott is killed in a mysterious accident, the business suffers setbacks, and friendships
are stressed to the point of breaking. Christian faces a crisis, professionally and personally, and seeks
answers that lead him ultimately to a newfound faith and peace. Christian and Leigh weigh the possibilities
of selling their interest in the business and starting over. Meanwhile, the investigation into the death of Scott
Pierce uncovers surprises that no one expected . . . Opportunity is a textbook introducing free enterprise and
business principles in story form, complete with the suspense and intrigue of a novel. This "novel text"
integrates a survey of business disciplines with a biblical worldview. In enlightening ways the book explores
the integration of faith and ethics. As the story engages readers, it also teaches principles of free enterprise
and business.
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From reader reviews:

Latrice Miller:

The book Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your
spare time. You may use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend
when you getting tension or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a
book Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business to be your habit, you can get a lot more
advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may
know everything if you like start and read a reserve Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you
think about this reserve?

Robert Lindsey:

The knowledge that you get from Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business is a more deep you
digging the information that hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean
that this book is hard to understand but Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business giving you
thrill feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by
simply anyone who read this because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This particular book
also makes your current vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that Opportunity: Introducing Free
Enterprise and Business instantly.

Jessie Henricks:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the characters
do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Opportunity:
Introducing Free Enterprise and Business, you may tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a e-book.

Kimberly Wheatley:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you study a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that
you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with soon.



The Opportunity: Introducing Free Enterprise and Business will give you a new experience in reading
through a book.
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