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After giving up the worst goal of his NHL career and at the worst possible time—overtime of the Stanley
Cup Championship Game 7—Tyler McKenzie flees to Africa. But even a safari into the famed Serengeti
can’t wipe away the sting of his failure. He sees it everywhere he looks.

Except when he looks into the eyes of Angie Smolinski, an outspoken, bull-in-the-china-shop firecracker he
finds far more interesting than any of the beauties back home.

They fall head over heels for each other until the firecracker explodes like a bomb.

"David H. Hendrickson is one of my favorite writers." -- USA Today bestselling author Kristine Kathryn
Rusch
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From reader reviews:

Paul Flynn:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book No Defense. All type of book
could you see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Sean Bass:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of many ways
to share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to
imagine the story how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to some others.
When you read this No Defense, you are able to tells your family, friends and soon about yours guide. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a publication.

Lillian Robbins:

Beside that No Defense in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info.
The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from oven so don't always be worry if you feel
like an old people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have No Defense because this book offers to you
personally readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you don't get what it's facts concerning.
Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be
questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this book
along with read it from now!

Shaun Sae:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have
it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. That No Defense can give you a lot of pals because by you
considering this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person.
This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that possibly your
friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other make you to be great persons. So , why
hesitate? We need to have No Defense.
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