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Serious illness can be devastating. Imagine what it takes to overcome it - to overcome the devastation to the
body, to be robbed of one’s identity, confidence or independence, to face death, to persevere through the
horrors required to hold it at bay and, finally, to rebuild a life that will never be the same. Now imagine
having to do it over and over and over again.

That is exactly what Dr. Marie Kirchner Stone had to do, and she shares her experiences in her striking new
memoir, "Battling Death: A Different Life." Diagnosed at age twenty with Hodgkin’s Disease, Dr. Stone did
not know as she entered treatment that her health would never return to her. Throughout the following forty
years, she faced the Hodgkin’s Disease, breast cancer, thyroid cancer, cervical cancer, endometriosis, open-
heart surgery, a debilitating stroke and skin cancer; some were the result of her radiation treatments for the
Hodgkin’s, others were not. Yet her tale is not a simple litany of diseases and treatments, but rather an
inspiring and motivational triumph of the spirit over adversity, as she never once let the diseases that riddled
her keep her from living a full and productive life. Dedicated to teaching, she was repeatedly forced to start
anew, yet she never let go of her determination to teach and help the children realize the best in themselves.
To Dr. Stone, "[t]eaching promoted a symbiotic, constructive, and mutually beneficial mind-body outcome
both for the students and me."

A shining example of what it means never to quit, Dr. Stone’s extraordinary tale shows that while "Battling
Death" may indeed lead to a different kind of life, it can be a life well lived.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Davis:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled Battling Death: A Different Life your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
most aspect that maybe not known for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each and every
word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never
get before. The Battling Death: A Different Life giving you a different experience more than blown away the
mind but also giving you useful info for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern at this point is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like
winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Rose Cordeiro:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Battling Death: A Different Life can be the reply,
oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Barbara Shephard:

You can find this Battling Death: A Different Life by browse the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or
reviewing it may to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this e-book
are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the
modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right
now, choose your ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Karen Wilson:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of
news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Battling Death: A Different Life when you essential it?
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