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In 2004, the United States, five Central American countries, and the Dominican Republic signed the Central
American Free Trade Agreement (CAFTA), signaling the region's commitment to a neoliberal economic
model. For many, however, neoliberalism had lost its luster as the new century dawned, and resistance
movements began to gather force. Contesting Trade in Central America is the first book-length study of the
debate over CAFTA, tracing the agreement's drafting, its passage, and its aftermath across Central America.

Rose J. Spalding draws on nearly two hundred interviews with representatives from government, business,
civil society, and social movements to analyze the relationship between the advance of free market reform in
Central America and the parallel rise of resistance movements. She views this dynamic through the lens of
Karl Polanyi's "double movement" theory, which posits that significant shifts toward market economics will
trigger oppositional, self-protective social countermovements. Examining the negotiations, political
dynamics, and agents involved in the passage of CAFTA in Costa Rica, El Salvador, and Nicaragua,
Spalding argues that CAFTA served as a high-profile symbol against which Central American oppositions
could rally. Ultimately, she writes, post-neoliberal reform "involves not just the design of appropriate policy
mixes and sequences, but also the hard work of building sustainable and inclusive political coalitions, ones
that prioritize the quality of social bonds over raw economic freedom."
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Trimm:

The ability that you get from Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance may be
the more deep you searching the information that hide inside words the more you get enthusiastic about
reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but Contesting Trade in Central America: Market
Reform and Resistance giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the idea because the author of this reserve is well-
known enough. This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to
understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
kind of Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance instantly.

David Patton:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Contesting Trade
in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance suitable to you? The actual book was written by well-
known writer in this era. The book untitled Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and
Resistanceis a single of several books in which everyone read now. That book was inspired many people in
the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know just
before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core
of this guide. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. So you can see the
represented of the world within this book.

Deborah Hart:

This Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance is great reserve for you because
the content that is full of information for you who also always deal with world and have to make decision
every minute. That book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling
sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides straight forward sentences but difficult core information with wonderful delivering sentences.
Having Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance in your hand like obtaining the
world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you world in ten or
fifteen minute right but this reserve already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hello Mr. and
Mrs. hectic do you still doubt in which?

Richard Mills:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Contesting Trade in Central America: Market
Reform and Resistance was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
Contesting Trade in Central America: Market Reform and Resistance has many kinds or variety. Start from
kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on



there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and
unwind. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading this.
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