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Undesirable Practices examines both the intended and the unintended consequences of “imperial feminism”
and British colonial interventions in “undesirable” cultural practices in northern Ghana. Jessica Cammaert
addresses the state management of social practices such as female circumcision, nudity, prostitution, and
“illicit” adoption as well as the hesitation to impose severe punishments for the slave dealing of females,
particularly female children. She examines the gendered power relations and colonial attitudes that targeted
women and children spanning pre- and postcolonial periods, the early postindependence years, and post-
Nkrumah policies. In particular, Cammaert examines the limits of the male colonial gaze and argues that the
power lay not in the gaze itself but in the act of “looking away,” a calculated aversion of attention intended
to maintain the tribal community and retain control over the movement, sexuality, and labor of women and
children.

With its examination of broader time periods and topics and its complex analytical arguments, Undesirable
Practices makes a valuable contribution to literature in African studies, contemporary advocacy discourse,
women and gender studies, and critical postcolonial studies.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Vanness:

The book Undesirable Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-
1972 (Expanding Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality) can
give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important
thing like a book Undesirable Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana,
1930-1972 (Expanding Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and
Sexuality)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim this book can give many
data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take
for that, you are able to give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Undesirable Practices:
Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-1972 (Expanding Frontiers:
Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality) has simple shape but the truth is
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a
book. So it is very wonderful.

Grady Meraz:

The event that you get from Undesirable Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in
Northern Ghana, 1930-1972 (Expanding Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women,
Gender, and Sexuality) could be the more deep you rooting the information that hide within the words the
more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but
Undesirable Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-1972
(Expanding Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality) giving you
excitement feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through
anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This particular book
also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along with
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this specific Undesirable
Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-1972 (Expanding
Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality) instantly.

Donald Wexler:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Undesirable
Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-1972 (Expanding
Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality) which is finding the e-
book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.



Nora Emerson:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named
of book Undesirable Practices: Women, Children, and the Politics of the Body in Northern Ghana, 1930-
1972 (Expanding Frontiers: Interdisciplinary Approaches to Studies of Women, Gender, and Sexuality). You
can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and
make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from
one destination to other place.
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