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Limerence Press is pleased to expose you to the sexiest coloring book you’ve ever seen—Oh Joy Sex Toy:
The Coloring Book! This approachable and sex-positive title gathers nearly 60 delightfully dirty and
informative drawings for you to dive into. We guarantee that if you break out the crayons,
watercolors—maybe even grab a friend and some body paint—you’ll have a blast and learn a sexy thing or
two while you’re at it.

The inspiration for this saucy offering began online, where every week Erika Moen draws a pornucopia of
fun, naughty pairings for the critically-acclaimed sex education comic Oh Joy Sex Toy. Now YOU can join
in the sexy fun by adding your own color choices in Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book! An alluring
collection of NSFW illustrations, featuring a wide variety of sexy humans, awaits you! Whether you want to
color for relaxation, saucy enjoyment, or to make a unique work of art for a special someone, this book is
sure to please.

“Price Includes VAT”
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From reader reviews:

Grace Moreno:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this specific aren't like that. This Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book book is readable through
you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable studying
experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer regarding
Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book content conveys thinking easily to understand by many people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different as it. So , do you still thinking
Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Mohammed Thomas:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book.

Treva Ritter:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that
need more time to be read. Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book can be your answer as it can be read by a
person who have those short spare time problems.

Anna Sanders:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in the top
collection in your reading list is definitely Oh Joy Sex Toy: The Coloring Book. This book which is qualified
as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking up and review
this reserve you can get many advantages.
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