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A man with a preternatural ability to find emerging artists, Richard Bellamy was one of the first advocates of
pop art, minimalism, and conceptual art. The founder and director of the fabled Green Gallery on Fifty-
Seventh Street, the witty, poetry-loving art lover became a legend of the avant-garde, showing the work of
artists such as Mark di Suvero, Claes Oldenburg, James Rosenquist, Donald Judd, and others.

Born to an American father and a Chinese mother in a Cincinnati suburb, Bellamy moved to New York and
made a life for himself between the Beat orbits of Provincetown and white-glove events such as the
Guggenheim's opening gala. He partied with Norman Mailer, was friends with Diane Arbus and Yoko Ono,
and frequently hosted or performed in Allan Kaprow's happenings. Always more concerned with art than
with making a profit, Bellamy withdrew when the market mushroomed around him, letting his
contemporaries and friends, such as Leo Castelli and Sidney Janis, capitalize on the stars he first discovered.
Bellamy's life story is a fascinating window into the transformation of art in the late twentieth century.

Based on decades of research and hundreds of interviews with artists, friends, dealers, and lovers, Judith
Stein's Eye of the Sixties recovers the elusive Bellamy and tells the story of a counterculture that became the
mainstream.

--

"Bellamy had an understanding of art and a very fine sense of discovery. There was nobody like him, I think.
I certainly consider myself his pupil." --Leo Castelli
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From reader reviews:

John Folsom:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something
that they don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Eye of the Sixties:
Richard Bellamy and the Transformation of Modern Art. All type of book is it possible to see on many
sources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Betty Epperson:

This Eye of the Sixties: Richard Bellamy and the Transformation of Modern Art are generally reliable for
you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The reason of this Eye of the Sixties: Richard
Bellamy and the Transformation of Modern Art can be one of several great books you must have is usually
giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you actually with information that maybe
will shock your prior knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever
your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Eye of the Sixties: Richard Bellamy and the
Transformation of Modern Art giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving
you trial of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and luxuriate in
reading.

Louise Graham:

Reading a book to become new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you
read a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, and soon. The Eye of the Sixties: Richard Bellamy and the Transformation of Modern Art provide
you with new experience in studying a book.

Thomas Brown:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Eye of the Sixties: Richard
Bellamy and the Transformation of Modern Art which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's find.
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