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Phil K Swift is one of the coolest cats you will ever meet in your entire wildest fantasy of a life, for real. He
is a legend in his own mind whose world revolves around break dancing, girls, hip-hop, house music, and a
rock n roll lifestyle. This hella-crazy ass adventure is about the underground culture of the 1980’s break
dance scene that tracks the life and times of a sometimes cocky, sometimes awkward high schooler that
realizes teen peer pressure can really be a “Punk Ass Bee-otch sometimes.” Swift navigates the tough Windy
City streets of Chicagoland and brings together a diverse group of Bboys (breakers) that become known as
the Neighborhood Street Rockers. Included is a Bboy, Boogie Bob, who has Leukemia, which forces Phil to
think about grown up stuff that, “usually only hundred year olds have to think about.” There is plenty of
crude humor in this “slice of Americana” and “coming of age story.” GUYS: If you are asked, “Do you want
a free pizza?” you most likely will want to say “NO!” Go to: TheezNutz.com and see why. (Yes, look at
Theez Nutz.) GIRLS: While reading this novel you will learn that BOYS WILL LIE THEIR TEETH OFF to
try and get “what” they want from you. (Yes, you know “what” I’m talking about.) If you have ever been
“played” or are the “player” you must read this book NOW! Can Phil and his crew make it out of the
gangbanger laden Chicagoland Rink alive? Read NOW and find out. If you have ever roller-skated to disco
music, break-danced to hip hop, grooved to house music, watched local rock bands play live, have followed
the DJ scene, or you want to learn more about it, then this book is for you
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From reader reviews:

Carol Shull:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a guide you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, studying a book will make you more imaginative. When you reading
a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the character
types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Phil K Swift
and the Neighborhood Street Rockers: a Chicago Bboys tale, you may tells your family, friends along with
soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Lisa Christopher:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its handle may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer could be Phil K Swift and the Neighborhood Street Rockers: a Chicago
Bboys tale why because the excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not
disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th
sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

David Wysocki:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several books in the
top listing in your reading list is actually Phil K Swift and the Neighborhood Street Rockers: a Chicago
Bboys tale. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into
precious person. By looking upward and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Tim Andrus:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And
also you know that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know
that reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by
book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is niagra Phil K Swift
and the Neighborhood Street Rockers: a Chicago Bboys tale.
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